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transferring the experience of older generations to younger people, has been used since antiquity. In a 
modernuniversitythatreliesontheactivationandintensificationoftheeducationalprocess, quizzes a reused in 
the following cases: 

� as independent technologies for mastering a concept, topic, and even a section of a subject; 

� as elements (sometimes quite essential) of a larger technology; 

� as a lesson (class) or part of it (introduction, explanation, consolidation, exercise, control); 

� as technology for extracurricular activities. 

There are certain requirements for organizing a quiz. 

1. A quiz is a form of student activity in which the world around is realized, and space is opened for 
personal activity and creativity. 

2. The quiz should be fun based and the participants should enjoy the quiz. 

3. An element of competition between the participants of the quiz is required. 

The requirements for the selection of the quiz are as follows: 

1. Quizzes must comply with certain educational tasks, program requirements for knowledge, skills, and 
standard requirements. 

2. Quizzes should correspond to the material being studied and be built taking into account the 
preparedness of students and their psychological characteristics. 

3. Quizzes should be based on certain didactic material and methods of its application. 

In the practice of a teacher, one can apply quiz-illustrations, situations-assessments, situations-exercises, 
the ways of presenting which can be very different. For example, a quiz method is proposed: for 
successful work, a physics teacher must be familiar with professional periodicals, among which are 
journals. The teacher must master the methodology of using quizzes, know the forms of working with 
them, be able to carry out a critical analysis of texts, offer their own solutions to the problems studied, 
and be able to generalize pedagogical experience.The lesson can be held in the form of a round table. For 
example, the problem of introducing modular technology into the educational process of universities is 
being studied, which is considered as a means of implementing student-centered learning.Students can be 
offered reflecting the experience of introducing modular learning into the educational process; find out 
the possibilities of using this technology, the positive aspects, the conditions under which this technology 
can be applied, the difficulties that teachers and students may encounter during modular training. It is 
desirable that the participants of the round table prepare quizzes of their messages [11-15]. 

In addition, each participant of the round table must compose answers on this issue and propose for 
analysis their own version of the module program on one topic of the physics course of a specialized 
university. The quiz method allows you to include all students in active work, establish feedback, and 
establish control over the quality of education. In the process of using this technology, the teacher 
prepares options for discussion in advance, and you can also indicate the main directions for finding a 
solution to the problem. When performing a quiz on the methodology of teaching physics, the method of 
collective creative solutions is used. Students are given a general task and the methods of its 
implementation for individual elements are specified. 

Performing part of the task proposed to all, the student must be able to assess the role of this task in the 
overall plan of work, to subordinate its implementation to a common goal. The quiz method is used in 
teaching the methodology of physics classroom equipment, using a physical experiment in the classroom, 
thematic and lesson planning, working with lagging behind, etc.Quiz games are of great importance for 
the development of initiative and creativity of students in the process of forming professional 
competencies. We most often use games that simulate the educational process at the university. Students 
are divided into two groups. Some prepare fragments of lessons of various types, which are then carried 
out in the classroom.[5-12]. 

When choosing and preparing fragments of the lesson, students are given the freedom of creativity. At the 
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same time, fragments are prepared for teaching by students using both traditional and innovative teaching 
technologies. Forexample, 
fragmentsoflessonsusingsuchteachingmethodsarousedgreatinterestamongstudents. 

The use of a quiz in physics lessons expands the possibilities of a demonstration experiment through the 
use of virtual images, allows you to create a single information space, implement continuous learning 
through a distance education system, implement individual-personal learning, develop the skills of 
independent search for the necessary information and its critical selection, and also show how computer 
technologies are practically used in physical science. 

Effective work with the quiz is aimed at both individual independent work of students with the quiz 
materials, and work in small groups to discuss the problem and agree on its possible solutions. The 
traditional scheme of working with a quiz consists of the following 4 stages: 

Stage 1. Introduction to a specific issue. Focused on understanding the problem. 

Stage 2. Search. Includes an assessment of information obtained from the engagement materials and self-
drawn. It is aimed at developing the ability to find the information necessary to find a solution and 
evaluate it. 

Stage 3. Discussion. Discussing the possibilities of alternative solutions allows you to develop alternative 
thinking. 

Stage 4. Dispute. Separate groups of students defend their decision. At this stage, there is a comparison 
and evaluation of solutions. 

Stage 5 Comparison of results. Comparison of decisions made in different groups of students. This stage 
involves a reasoned defense of decisions. 

Stage 6 Resolution, that is, finding a solution in groups. At this stage, the final results are summed up and 
the interrelated interests of individual decisions are evaluated. 

Results.Quizzes occupy an important place in the educational process, as they not only contribute to the 
education of cognitive interests and the activation of students’ activities, but also perform a number of 
other functions: 

1. A properly organized game, taking into account the specifics of the material, trains memory, helps 
students develop speech skills and abilities; 

2. the game stimulates the mental activity of students, develops attention and cognitive interest in the 
subject; 

3. quiz - oneofthemethodsofovercomingthepassivityofstudents; 

4. As part of a team, each student is responsible for the entire team, each is interested in the best result of 
his team, each strives to complete the task as quickly and successfully as possible. Thus, 
thecompetitioncontributestotheenhancementoftheperformanceofallstudents. 

Conclusion. In conclusion, I would like to note that the use of a quiz for the study of physics serves to 
activate the process of thinking and increase interest in the subject, develops the ability for independent 
learning and the application of theoretical knowledge in physics in life. Thus, the modern system of 
teaching aids allows you to engage in the learning process individually, in creative groups, classes or 
classrooms. The quiz allows both the student and the teacher to search and collect new information, 
develop and create modern teaching aids. 
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